			Muni	cipal Services			
BOT Meeting Date							
5/24/2023							
	Invoice				Period		
Invoice Date	Number	Vendor	Acct. #	Description	Ending		Amount
5/10/2023		Carlisle Wortman	704.820	MS General Planning Consultation			\$ 13,730.00
						TOTAL	\$13,730.00



117 NORTH FIRST STREET SUITE 70 ANN ARBOR, MI 48104 734.662.2200 734.662.1935 FAX

]	INVOICE
Elizabeth Bergeron Pittsfield Township 6201 Michigan Avenue Ann Arbor, MI 48108			Invoice No. Client No.: Date: Period End:			2169287 222 05/10/23 4/30/2023
Planning Co	onsultat	ion				
4/3/2023	LK	Office hours: phone and email consultation; zoning compliance review; building permit review	4.50 @	110.00/hr	=	495.00
4/4/2023	LK	Office hours: phone and email consultation; zoning compliance review; building permit review; ARC agenda; pre-development meeting prep.	4.00 @	110.00/hr	-	440.00
4/5/2023	LK	Office hours: phone and email consultation; zoning compliance review; building permit review; ARC attendance; pre-development meeting attendance.	4.50 @	110.00/hr	=	495.00
	BC	Township office hours including project coordination with staff, returned emails from applicants and residents. Coordination with Supervisor.	8.00 @	120.00/hr	-	960.00
4/6/2023	LK	Office hours: phone and email consultation; zoning compliance; building permit review.	7.00 @	110.00/hr		770.00
4/10/2023	LK	Office hours: phone and email consultation; zoning compliance review; building plan review.	4.50 @	110.00/hr	=	495.00

Carlisle Wortman		Associates, Inc.		Invoice No.		2169287 05/10/23
4/10/2023	BC	Township office hours including project coordination with staff, ARC meeting preparation, returned emails from applicants and residents.	6.00 @	120.00/hr	=	720.00
4/11/2023	LK	Office hours: phone and email consultation; zoning compliance review; building permit review.	4.00 @	110.00/hr	-	440.00
4/12/2023	LK	Office hours: phone and email consultation; zoning compliance review; building permit review; ARC attendance; pre-development meeting.	4.50 @	110.00/hr	=	495.00
	BC	Township office hours including project coordination with staff, returned emails from applicants and residents. Coordination with Supervisor.	8.00 @	120.00/hr	:=	960.00
4/13/2023	LK	Office hours: phone and email consultation; zoning compliance; building permit review.	3.50 @	110.00/hr	-	385.00
4/14/2023	LK	Office hours: phone and email consultation; zoning compliance; building permit review.	5.00 @	110.00/hr	=	550.00
4/17/2023	LK	Office hours: prepare ZBA agenda; email and phone consultation; zoning compliance; building permit review.	1.50 @	110.00/hr	=	165.00
	BC	Township office hours including project coordination with staff, ARC meeting preparation, returned emails from applicants and residents.	6.00 @	120.00/hr	-	720.00
4/18/2023	LK	Office hours: phone and email consultation; zoning compliance; building permit review.	3.50 @	110.00/hr	-	385.00
4/19/2023	LK	Office hours: phone and email consultation; zoning compliance review; building permit review.	4.50 @	110.00/hr	=	495.00

Carlisle Wortman		Associates, Inc.	Invoice No.		2169287 05/10/23	
4/20/2023	LK	Office hours: phone and email consultation; zoning compliance; building permit review.	2.50 @	110.00/hr	-	275.00
4/21/2023	LK	Office hours: phone and email consultation; zoning compliance; building permit review.	4.00 @	110.00/hr		440.00
4/24/2023	LK	Office hours: phone and email consultation; zoning compliance; building permit review; PC minutes review; ZBA suggested motions.	3.50 @	110.00/hr	=	385.00
	LK	(1) NIGHT MEETING: ZBA meeting prep and attendance.	2.00 @	110.00/hr	=	220.00
	BC	Township office hours including project coordination with staff, ARC meeting preparation, returned emails from applicants and residents.	6.00 @	120.00/hr	=	720.00
4/25/2023	LK	Office hours: phone and email consultation; zoning compliance; building permit review.	3.00 @	110.00/hr	-	330.00
4/26/2023	LK	Office hours: phone and email consultation; zoning compliance; building permit review; ARC attendance.	4.50 @	110.00/hr	= 1	495.00
	BC	Township office hours including project coordination with staff, returned emails from applicants and residents. Coordination with Supervisor.	8.00 @	120.00/hr	=	960.00
4/27/2023	LK	Office hours: PC packet review; phone and email consultation; zoning compliance; building permit review.	2.50 @	110.00/hr	-	275.00
4/28/2023	LK	Office hours: phone and email consultation; zoning compliance; building permit review; site inspections.	6.00 @	110.00/hr	-	660.00

AMOUNT DUE THIS INVOICE:

\$13,730.00